
Differences Between Dual Credit and AP 

Dual Credit English 3  AP Language & Composition  

Attendance :  TCC has attendance 
requirements of 90%, much like BHS. 
However, there is no way to make up hours in 
a TCC class. So, taking a Dual Credit course 
means showing up for class, or potentially 
losing credit.  

Attendance : Uses the standard BISD policy 
for attendance and make up hours. 

Grading : Dual Credit Courses generally have 
fewer total grades in a semester, thus each 
grade has a higher weight. While there may be 
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find it easier to earn credit by passing a 
course, rather than based on one test. 
However, this credit does impact your GPA. 
Meaning, if you earn a C in the class, you earn 
a C on your college transcripts. College GPAs 
work very differentl y than how we calculate 
GPA at BHS, and it is important for students 
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Exposure to College Level Skills:  In 
Comp I, time is spent working on the skill of 
being a college student. That includes any of 
the following: formatting essays/MLA, using 
research databases, communicating with 
professors, navigating systems (like Canvas). 
This is particularly helpful to students who do 
not have suppl


